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When Alfred Kinsey's massive studies Sexual Behavior in the Human Male and Sexual Behavior in the
Human Female appeared in 1948 and 1953, their detailed data spurred an unprecedented public discussion of
the nation's sexual practices and ideologies. As they debated what behaviors were normal or average,
abnormal or deviant, Cold War Americans also celebrated and scrutinized the state of their nation, relating
apparent changes in sexuality to shifts in its political structure, economy, and people. American Sexual
Character employs the studies and the myriad responses they evoked to examine national debates about
sexuality, gender, and Americanness after World War II. Focusing on the mutual construction of postwar
ideas about national identity and sexual life, this wide-ranging, shrewd, and lively analysis explores the
many uses to which these sex surveys were put at a time of extreme anxiety about sexual behavior and its
effects on the nation.

Looking at real and perceived changes in masculinity, female sexuality, marriage, and homosexuality,
Miriam G. Reumann develops the notion of "American sexual character," sexual patterns and attitudes that
were understood to be uniquely American and to reflect contemporary transformations in politics, social life,
gender roles, and culture. She considers how apparent shifts in sexual behavior shaped the nation's
workplaces, homes, and families, and how these might be linked to racial and class differences.
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From reader reviews:

Eleanor Walker:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yes, you can
choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare time to take a
go walking, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open as well as read a book eligible
American Sexual Character: Sex, Gender, and National Identity in the Kinsey Reports? Maybe it is being
best activity for you. You know beside you can spend your time with your favorite's book, you can smarter
than before. Do you agree with the opinion or you have other opinion?

Pam Gray:

This book untitled American Sexual Character: Sex, Gender, and National Identity in the Kinsey Reports to
be one of several books that will best seller in this year, honestly, that is because when you read this reserve
you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to buy this book in the book shop or you can order it via
online. The publisher in this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly to read this book, because you
can read this book in your Touch screen phone. So there is no reason for you to past this guide from your list.

George Jamison:

The book with title American Sexual Character: Sex, Gender, and National Identity in the Kinsey Reports
includes a lot of information that you can learn it. You can get a lot of profit after read this book. That book
exist new expertise the information that exist in this book represented the condition of the world right now.
That is important to yo7u to find out how the improvement of the world. This book will bring you inside new
era of the globalization. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you
want.

Marylouise Potter:

Publication is one of source of expertise. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen will need book to know the revise information of year to help year. As we know
those publications have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the
world. Through the book American Sexual Character: Sex, Gender, and National Identity in the Kinsey
Reports we can acquire more advantage. Don't you to be creative people? Being creative person must want to
read a book. Just simply choose the best book that acceptable with your aim. Don't become doubt to change
your life by this book American Sexual Character: Sex, Gender, and National Identity in the Kinsey Reports.
You can more pleasing than now.
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