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The siege of Yorktown in the fall of 1781 was the most decisive engagement of the American Revolution.
The campaign has all the drama any historian or student could want: the war's top generals and admirals
pitted against one another; decisive naval engagements; cavalry fighting; siege warfare; night bayonet
attacks; and more. Until now, however, no modern scholarly treatment of the campaign has ever been
produced.

By the summer of 1781, America had been at war with England for six years. No one believed in 1775 that
the colonists would put up such a long and credible struggle. France sided with the colonies in 1778, but it
was the dispatch of 5,500 infantry under Rochambeau in the summer of 1780 that shifted the tide of war
against the British.

In early 1781, after his victories in the Southern Colonies, Lord Cornwallis marched his army north into
Virginia. He believed the Americans could be decisively defeated in Virginia and the war brought to an end.
George Washington believed Cornwallis's move was a strategic blunder, and he moved vigorously to exploit
it. Feinting against General Clinton and the British stronghold of New York, Washington marched his army
quickly south. With the assistance of Rochambeau's infantry and a key French naval victory at the Battle off
the Capes in September, Washington trapped Cornwallis on the tip of a narrow Virginia peninsula at a place
called Yorktown. And so it began.

Operating on the belief that Clinton would arrive with reinforcements, Cornwallis confidently remained
within Yorktown's inadequate defenses. Determined that nothing short of outright surrender would suffice,
his opponent labored day and night to achieve that end. Washington's brilliance was on display as he
skillfully constricted Cornwallis's position by digging entrenchments, erecting redoubts and artillery
batteries, and launching well-timed attacks to capture key enemy positions. The nearly flawless Allied
campaign sealed Cornwallis's fate. Trapped inside crumbling defenses, he surrendered on October 19, 1781,
effectively ending the war in North America.

Penned by historian Jerome A. Greene, The Guns of Independence: The Siege of Yorktown, 1781, now
available in paperback, offers a complete and balanced examination of the siege and the participants
involved. Greene's study is based upon extensive archival research and firsthand archaeological investigation
of the battlefield. This fresh and invigorating study will satisfy everyone interested in American
Revolutionary history, artillery, siege tactics, and brilliant leadership.

About the Author: Jerome A. Greene is a retired historian with the National Park Service. He is the author or
editor of many books, including Morning Star Dawn: The Powder River Expedition and the Northern
Cheyenne, 1876, Washita: The U.S. Army and the Southern Cheyennes, 1867-1869, and Indian War
Veterans. Mr. Greene resides in Colorado.
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From reader reviews:

John Cleveland:

Why? Because this The Guns of Independence: The Siege of Yorktown, 1781 is an unordinary book that the
inside of the book waiting for you to snap that but latter it will distress you with the secret it inside. Reading
this book adjacent to it was fantastic author who write the book in such awesome way makes the content
inside of easier to understand, entertaining technique but still convey the meaning totally. So , it is good for
you for not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This excellent book will give you a lot
of benefits than the other book possess such as help improving your skill and your critical thinking means.
So , still want to hold up having that book? If I were you I will go to the guide store hurriedly.

Henry Reavis:

Reading a book to become new life style in this yr; every people loves to read a book. When you study a
book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge,
simply because book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts
of book that you have read. If you want to get information about your research, you can read education
books, but if you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, such us novel, comics, and also
soon. The The Guns of Independence: The Siege of Yorktown, 1781 will give you a new experience in
studying a book.

Grace Godwin:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our expertise for everything. By a guide we can know
everything we wish. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year was
exactly added. This e-book The Guns of Independence: The Siege of Yorktown, 1781 was filled with regards
to science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your scientific disciplines competence. Some
people has distinct feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you
can feel enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book that you wanted.

David Byrd:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is written or printed or highlighted from each source that will filled update of
news. Within this modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for you actually.
From media social like newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic.
You can add your understanding by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to spread out your
book? Or just seeking the The Guns of Independence: The Siege of Yorktown, 1781 when you desired it?
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