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Before this book, general readers who wanted a compact but comprehensive history of American military
action in World War II had nowhere to turn. Now, in this concise, lucid, and balanced account, D. Clayton
James and Anne Sharp Wells provide the first one volume history of the U.S. armed forces in the war.
Examining the strategy, logistics, high command, operations, and home-front aspects of the military
campaign, they narrate the story .in slightly more than 200 pages, with a clarity and perspective that virtually
any reader will appreciate. In addition to describing the major operations and battles, and analyzing strategy
and tactics, From Pearl Harbor to V-J Day contains crisp portraits of major military leaders and a
background of political, diplomatic, economic, and social developments in the warring nations. Also
receiving attention are the role of women and minorities in the military; the relation of armed forces
personnel to the American home front; the impact of technology; and the breakthroughs of communications
intelligence. In a final chapter the authors consider the consequences of the war for American society and
suggest that romanticized views of the conflict should finally be laid to rest.
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From reader reviews:

Leslie Hackett:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive at this
point, people have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place
and notice by surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated the idea for a while is
reading. That's why, by reading a e-book your ability to survive boost then having chance to stand up than
other is high. To suit your needs who want to start reading any book, we give you that From Pearl Harbor to
V-J Day: The American Armed Forces in World War II (American Ways Series) book as basic and daily
reading guide. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Mary Fleeman:

Often the book From Pearl Harbor to V-J Day: The American Armed Forces in World War II (American
Ways Series) will bring that you the new experience of reading any book. The author style to elucidate the
idea is very unique. When you try to find new book to study, this book very suitable to you. The book From
Pearl Harbor to V-J Day: The American Armed Forces in World War II (American Ways Series) is much
recommended to you to learn. You can also get the e-book through the official web site, so you can more
readily to read the book.

Jennifer Yost:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book particularly book entitled
From Pearl Harbor to V-J Day: The American Armed Forces in World War II (American Ways Series) your
mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each aspect that maybe unknown for but surely
will end up your mind friends. Imaging just about every word written in a publication then become one
contact form conclusion and explanation that maybe you never get previous to. The From Pearl Harbor to V-
J Day: The American Armed Forces in World War II (American Ways Series) giving you another experience
more than blown away your brain but also giving you useful details for your better life in this era. So now let
us demonstrate the relaxing pattern this is your body and mind is going to be pleased when you are finished
reading it, like winning a sport. Do you want to try this extraordinary shelling out spare time activity?

Stephen Comerford:

As a university student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library
or to make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's heart and soul
or real their passion. They just do what the educator want, like asked to the library. They go to there but
nothing reading critically. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring as well as can't see colorful
pics on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we know that on this
age, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore
this From Pearl Harbor to V-J Day: The American Armed Forces in World War II (American Ways Series)



can make you really feel more interested to read.
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