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This book examines how inter- and intra-party coalition-building affects governability in South Korea.
Focusing on the Kim Dae-jung administration (1998-2003) as a case study in the failure of a government to
turn electoral success into stable governability, or ability to implement reform policies, the book’s research
draws on two bodies of literature which, though focusing on the same dependent variable (cabinet or
government stability), have rarely been used in tandem: coalition research on parliamentary systems and
studies of divided government in presidential systems.

Youngmi Kim argues that a weak institutionalization of the ruling party and the party-system accounts for
political instability and inefficient governability in Korea and in doing so her study makes a number of key
contributions to the field. Theoretically it proposes a framework which integrates a rationalist approach with
one that acknowledges the role of political culture. It further enhances the understanding of factors affecting
governability after coalition-building across regime types and aims to build on recent demands for broader
cross-regime analysis of minority/divided government and of the determinants of governability. This has
important comparative implications as coalition-building within (semi-) presidential systems has occurred in
other post-authoritarian contexts. The book finally provides a new dataset which fills a gap in a field where
Western cases constitute the main focus of research.

The Politics of Coalition in Korea will be of interest to students and scholars of Korean studies, Korean
politics, Asian studies and Asian politics.

Youngmi Kim is Assistant Professor at the Departments of Public Policy, and International Relations and
European Studies at Central European University, Budapest, Hungary.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Jones:

What do you consider book? It is just for students since they are still students or the item for all people in the
world, what the best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that query above. Every person has
different personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they
don't need do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book The Politics of Coalition in
Korea: Between Institutions and Culture (Routledge Advances in Korean Studies). All type of book is it
possible to see on many options. You can look for the internet sources or other social media.

George Clark:

This The Politics of Coalition in Korea: Between Institutions and Culture (Routledge Advances in Korean
Studies) book is simply not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you
have by reading this book is definitely information inside this publication incredible fresh, you will get facts
which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of information you will get. This kind of The Politics of
Coalition in Korea: Between Institutions and Culture (Routledge Advances in Korean Studies) without we
know teach the one who reading it become critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't be worry The Politics
of Coalition in Korea: Between Institutions and Culture (Routledge Advances in Korean Studies) can bring
any time you are and not make your handbag space or bookshelves' turn into full because you can have it
inside your lovely laptop even mobile phone. This The Politics of Coalition in Korea: Between Institutions
and Culture (Routledge Advances in Korean Studies) having great arrangement in word and also layout, so
you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Kimberly Towe:

This The Politics of Coalition in Korea: Between Institutions and Culture (Routledge Advances in Korean
Studies) is great e-book for you because the content that is full of information for you who also always deal
with world and still have to make decision every minute. That book reveal it facts accurately using great
arrange word or we can claim no rambling sentences inside. So if you are read the idea hurriedly you can
have whole information in it. Doesn't mean it only gives you straight forward sentences but difficult core
information with attractive delivering sentences. Having The Politics of Coalition in Korea: Between
Institutions and Culture (Routledge Advances in Korean Studies) in your hand like keeping the world in your
arm, data in it is not ridiculous one. We can say that no reserve that offer you world throughout ten or fifteen
second right but this publication already do that. So , this is certainly good reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs.
hectic do you still doubt this?

Florence Ross:

A number of people said that they feel bored when they reading a publication. They are directly felt the item
when they get a half areas of the book. You can choose the particular book The Politics of Coalition in



Korea: Between Institutions and Culture (Routledge Advances in Korean Studies) to make your own reading
is interesting. Your own skill of reading proficiency is developing when you like reading. Try to choose
simple book to make you enjoy you just read it and mingle the impression about book and studying
especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to available a book and learn it. Beside that the guide The
Politics of Coalition in Korea: Between Institutions and Culture (Routledge Advances in Korean Studies) can
to be your brand new friend when you're feel alone and confuse in doing what must you're doing of these
time.
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