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He’s British football’s philosopher manqué. The most successful England manager we never had and a
genuine footballing legend. To many, an outspoken working class hero. To others – mainly his targets – he
was a bolshy northern gobshite. Never less than opinionated, often controversial and always eloquent, here
we present Brian Clough, in his very own words… On himself: ‘I wouldn’t say I was the best manager in the
business. But I was in the top one.’ On Roy Keane: ‘I only ever hit Roy once. He got up, so I couldn’t have
hit him very hard.’ On the FA: ‘I’m sure the England selectors thought if they took me on and gave me the
job I’d want to run the show. They were shrewd, because that’s exactly what I would have done.’ On being
nominated for a knighthood: ‘I thought it was my next door neighbour, because she thought if I got
something like that, I’d have to move.’ On handling players: ‘We talk about it for twenty minutes and then
we decide I was right.’ On drink: ‘Walk on water? I know most people out there will be saying that instead
of walking on it, I should have taken more of it with my drinks.’
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From reader reviews:

William Powell:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite book and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add your
knowledge by the guide entitled Old Big 'Ead: The Wit and Wisdom of Brian Clough. Try to face the book
Old Big 'Ead: The Wit and Wisdom of Brian Clough as your good friend. It means that it can to be your
friend when you truly feel alone and beside that course make you smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very
fortuned for yourself. The book makes you far more confidence because you can know anything by the book.
So , let me make new experience in addition to knowledge with this book.

Richard Haley:

The actual book Old Big 'Ead: The Wit and Wisdom of Brian Clough will bring that you the new experience
of reading some sort of book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. If you try to find new
book you just read, this book very acceptable to you. The book Old Big 'Ead: The Wit and Wisdom of Brian
Clough is much recommended to you to see. You can also get the e-book from the official web site, so you
can quicker to read the book.

Camille Wolfe:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always try to and must have the extra time or they will get large
amount of stress from both daily life and work. So , once we ask do people have extra time, we will say
absolutely of course. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity
are there when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer may unlimited right. Then do
you ever try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, the actual book
you have read is actually Old Big 'Ead: The Wit and Wisdom of Brian Clough.

Joyce Shryock:

Many people spending their period by playing outside using friends, fun activity together with family or just
watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by examining a book. Ugh,
do you think reading a book will surely hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It fine you can
have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Old Big 'Ead: The Wit and Wisdom
of Brian Clough which is obtaining the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's view.
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