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First published in 1998, The Lexicon of Labor found a large and appreciative following among readers who
were grateful to have the vibrant, powerful language of the labor movement captured in a lively single
volume. This long-awaited revised and updated edition includes dozens of new terms and developments that
will introduce a new generation to the labor lexicon, even as labor’s strength grows in the Obama era.

From Frederick Douglass to César Chavez, from the Haymarket Riots in 1886 to the Change to Win
federation formed in 2005, this classic labor lexicon provides concise, enlightening sketches of over five
hundred key places, people, and events in American labor history. A practical resource for students and
journalists, The Lexicon of Labor is as entertaining for longtime union members seeking to get reacquainted
with the traditions of the movement as it is for newcomers wishing to discover the unique language and
history of unionism.

The Lexicon of Labor also includes explanations of major legislative acts, definitions of key legal
terminology, and complete listings of all the member unions of the AFL-CIO and independent unions in the
United States. It is the perfect introduction to the history of labor in America.
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From reader reviews:

Katherine Ouellette:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With looking at you can get a lot of
information that will give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world could share their idea.
Books can also inspire a lot of people. Many author can inspire their own reader with their story or maybe
their experience. Not only situation that share in the guides. But also they write about advantage about
something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your children, there are
many kinds of book which exist now. The authors these days always try to improve their ability in writing,
they also doing some study before they write for their book. One of them is this The Lexicon of Labor: More
Than 500 Key Terms, Biographical Sketches, and Historical Insights Concerning Labor in America.

Lois Silvey:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with close friends is thing that
usually you could have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try thing that really opposite
from that. One activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
already been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love The Lexicon of Labor: More Than
500 Key Terms, Biographical Sketches, and Historical Insights Concerning Labor in America, you may
enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still wish to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh seriously
its mind hangout people. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on its called reading friends.

Fred Polak:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information better to
share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and
soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. Often the book that
recommended for you is The Lexicon of Labor: More Than 500 Key Terms, Biographical Sketches, and
Historical Insights Concerning Labor in America this e-book consist a lot of the information in the condition
of this world now. This specific book was represented so why is the world has grown up. The terminology
styles that writer value to explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer made some research when he
makes this book. That is why this book acceptable all of you.

Ellis Pauling:

As a student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library in order to
make summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's spirit or real their
interest. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to the library. They go to presently there but nothing
reading significantly. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring and can't see colorful
photographs on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important to suit your needs. As we know



that on this period, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's
country. So , this The Lexicon of Labor: More Than 500 Key Terms, Biographical Sketches, and Historical
Insights Concerning Labor in America can make you really feel more interested to read.
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