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Shalit draws on the research he conducted as field psychologist in the Israeli military to offer an original
behavioral model of combat that accounts for the fighting potential of an individual or group. His model is
based on the appraisal process that the individual undertakes in combat conditions to assess a situation,
whether it concerns him or not and regardless of his role. It is through this process that the individual makes
a judgment, taking into consideration his past experience, knowledge, and expectations, that in turn leads to a
course of action. Shalit pinpoints and describes specific aspects of the psychology of combat and conflict
including the motivation to act in combat with special reference to the aggression drive; the definition of an
enemy and the effects such appraisals have on behavior; the situational factors in heroic acts; and discipline
and its affects on combat efficiency.
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From reader reviews:

Jason Nunez:

The book The Psychology of Conflict and Combat can give more knowledge and also the precise product
information about everything you want. So why must we leave the good thing like a book The Psychology of
Conflict and Combat? A few of you have a different opinion about e-book. But one aim that will book can
give many information for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer along with your book.
Knowledge or information that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you could share all of
these. Book The Psychology of Conflict and Combat has simple shape however you know: it has great and
big function for you. You can seem the enormous world by start and read a publication. So it is very
wonderful.

Frank Johnson:

Often the book The Psychology of Conflict and Combat has a lot details on it. So when you make sure to
read this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was compiled by the very famous author. Tom makes
some research just before write this book. This particular book very easy to read you can get the point easily
after scanning this book.

Timothy Holeman:

Is it anyone who having spare time then spend it whole day by watching television programs or just lying on
the bed? Do you need something totally new? This The Psychology of Conflict and Combat can be the
answer, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your time by reading
in this fresh era is common not a geek activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?

Sherry Francis:

A lot of reserve has printed but it is unique. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the top
book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is named of book The Psychology
of Conflict and Combat. You can contribute your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the printed book,
it might add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most essential that, you must aware
about publication. It can bring you from one place to other place.
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