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In A Lost Touch of Bliss, Cain Veuxfort, Earl of Hawksdown, followed duty and broke Amice de
Monceaux's heart five years ago. But now he needs her. Amice is a Spirit Goddess, able to help restless souls
move on, and Cain needs a ghost to leave his castle. When Cain offers Amice an Italian villa on the sea,
Amice agrees to help. But there is more going on at Castle Falcon's Craig than a simple haunting and more
than one tragic tale of unrequited love. Yet to set things right for both the living and the dead, Cain and
Amice must move beyond their past. In A Lost Touch of Paradise, Lugh MacKeir, Laird of Tunvegan, finds
himself in a battle he cannot win. His precious daughter is dying of the same illness that claimed his wife.
The Isle of Parraba is a whispered legend, a place rumored to be ruled by a sorceress, an isle no one can
reach. Yet legend speaks of a powerful healer as well. Lugh MacKeir, desperate, determines he will find
Parraba and face its mysterious ruler. Iosobal is the Lady of Parraba, mystical and magical, a woman apart
from the world around her, but the child's illness defies Iosobal's skill. The secret to saving Lugh's daughter
lies in Iosobal's ability to open her heart to a brash warrior who has invaded her tranquil sanctuary. In A Lost
Touch of Innocence, Piers Veuxfort touched a magic crystal and freed the essence of wicked Fin Man, who
now resides within Piers. A surprise for Piers arrives at Falcon's Craig Castle: a bride who was raised to be a
nun and views him as something just short of the devil. What can he do but send her back? Condemned for
her "sight," Giselle St. Germain's is thrown out of the nunnery. Piers is devoted to his pleasures and
increasingly displays a dark side. What's a girl to do but cling more tightly to what she knows? In A Lost
Touch of Magic, Paroseea dwells hidden within the stone walls of a medieval fortress, Castle
MacCoinneach. Yet danger has escaped paradise and stalks the halls seeking vengeance. Padruig
MacCoinneach will do anything to save his clan. He never expected he would have to marry his ally's
daughter, whom he deems both a reckless child and a potent temptation. Aimili de Grantham has long
admired Padruig, but a dismissive stranger has replaced the golden man of her dreams. Worse, the fey part of
her senses that evil lurks in the shadows of Castle MacCoinneach, and she has nowhere to turn.
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From reader reviews:

Corine Ramirez:

The book A Lost Touch Series can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about
everything you want. So why must we leave a very important thing like a book A Lost Touch Series? Wide
variety you have a different opinion about book. But one aim in which book can give many information for
us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or details that you
take for that, it is possible to give for each other; you can share all of these. Book A Lost Touch Series has
simple shape but you know: it has great and big function for you. You can seem the enormous world by open
up and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Hazel Freese:

This A Lost Touch Series is great book for you because the content that is full of information for you who
always deal with world and have to make decision every minute. This book reveal it info accurately using
great arrange word or we can say no rambling sentences inside. So if you are read it hurriedly you can have
whole details in it. Doesn't mean it only will give you straight forward sentences but difficult core
information with lovely delivering sentences. Having A Lost Touch Series in your hand like keeping the
world in your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous a single. We can say that no e-book that offer you world inside
ten or fifteen minute right but this guide already do that. So , this is good reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs.
active do you still doubt in which?

Micheal Ruiz:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside along with friends, fun activity having family or just
watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by examining a book. Ugh,
ya think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It ok you can
have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like A Lost Touch Series which is
keeping the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's view.

Anthony Wilson:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. That book A Lost Touch Series was colourful and of course has
pictures on the website. As we know that book A Lost Touch Series has many kinds or style. Start from kids
until teenagers. For example Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and believe that you are the
character on there. Therefore , not at all of book tend to be make you bored, any it makes you feel happy, fun
and rest. Try to choose the best book for you and try to like reading this.
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