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As part of the Christian Science and New Thought movements, Holmes believed in the transformative power
of positive thinking and the innate ability of every person to affect their world and heal their body through
proper use of their mind. In this, his first book, published in 1919, he explains the underlying beliefs of
Religious Science and New Thought.

Students of religion and history will be interested to read Holmes's new cosmology, linking mind and
universe in a truly unique fashion, and anyone looking to improve their lives may find his method to be a
powerful new tool.

American author and preacher ERNEST SHURTLEFF HOLMES (1887-1960) began studying Christian
Science at age twenty-one and in 1912 built a church to spread the message of the New Thought movement.
His particular teachings came to be called Religious Science, which he codified in his most influential work,
The Science of Mind (1926).
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From reader reviews:

William Lyons:

The publication with title Creative Mind posesses a lot of information that you can understand it. You can
get a lot of benefit after read this book. This kind of book exist new knowledge the information that exist in
this publication represented the condition of the world right now. That is important to yo7u to learn how the
improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you with new era of the glowbal growth. You can
read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Stuart Perez:

Reading a book to be new life style in this year; every people loves to examine a book. When you read a
book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge,
because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book
that you have read. In order to get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but if you
want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, these us novel, comics, as well as soon. The Creative Mind
provide you with new experience in reading through a book.

Marcia Marshall:

This Creative Mind is fresh way for you who has fascination to look for some information as it relief your
hunger details. Getting deeper you in it getting knowledge more you know or perhaps you who still having
little digest in reading this Creative Mind can be the light food for you personally because the information
inside that book is easy to get by anyone. These books create itself in the form that is reachable by anyone,
sure I mean in the e-book contact form. People who think that in reserve form make them feel sleepy even
dizzy this book is the answer. So there is not any in reading a guide especially this one. You can find actually
looking for. It should be here for anyone. So , don't miss the item! Just read this e-book style for your better
life along with knowledge.

Jim Loop:

Guide is one of source of information. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen want book to know the update information of year to year. As we know those
textbooks have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the world.
By the book Creative Mind we can acquire more advantage. Don't someone to be creative people? Being
creative person must like to read a book. Only choose the best book that ideal with your aim. Don't end up
being doubt to change your life with that book Creative Mind. You can more pleasing than now.
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