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“A highly informative, detailed, even thrilling account of how the Supreme Court arguments reshaped
American law.”—Michael Bronkski, San Francisco Chronicle

No one could have predicted that the night of September 17, 1998, would be anything but routine in
Houston, Texas. Even the call to police that a black man was "going crazy with a gun" was hardly unusual in
this urban setting. Nobody could have imagined that the arrest of two men for a minor criminal offense
would reverberate in American constitutional law, exposing a deep malignity in our judicial system and
challenging the traditional conception of what makes a family. Indeed, when Harris County sheriff’s deputies
entered the second-floor apartment, there was no gun. Instead, they reported that they had walked in on John
Lawrence and Tyron Garner having sex in Lawrence’s bedroom.

So begins Dale Carpenter’s "gripping and brilliantly researched" Flagrant Conduct, a work nine years in the
making that transforms our understanding of what we thought we knew about Lawrence v. Texas, the
landmark Supreme Court decision of 2003 that invalidated America’s sodomy laws. Drawing on dozens of
interviews, Carpenter has taken on the "gargantuan" task of extracting the truth about the case, analyzing the
claims of virtually every person involved.

Carpenter first introduces us to the interracial defendants themselves, who were hardly prepared "for the
strike of lightning" that would upend their lives, and then to the Harris County arresting officers, including a
sheriff’s deputy who claimed he had "looked eye to eye" in the faces of the men as they allegedly fornicated.
Carpenter skillfully navigates Houston’s complex gay world of the late 1990s, where a group of activists and
court officers, some of them closeted themselves, refused to bury what initially seemed to be a minor arrest.

The author charts not only the careful legal strategy that Lambda Legal attorneys adopted to make the case
compatible to a conservative Supreme Court but also the miscalculations of the Houston prosecutors who
assumed that the nation’s extant sodomy laws would be upheld. Masterfully reenacting the arguments that
riveted spectators and Justices alike in 2003, Flagrant Conduct then reaches a point where legal history
becomes literature, animating a Supreme Court decision as few writers have done.

In situating Lawrence v. Texas within the larger framework of America’s four-century persecution of gay
men and lesbians, Flagrant Conduct compellingly demonstrates that gay history is an integral part of our
national civil rights story.
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From reader reviews:

Jesica Demarco:

Reading a book tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With studying you can get a lot
of information that may give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world can certainly share
their idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire all their reader with their
story or perhaps their experience. Not only situation that share in the ebooks. But also they write about the
information about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your children, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on this planet always try to improve
their talent in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write on their book. One of them is this
Flagrant Conduct: The Story of Lawrence v. Texas.

Michael Mitchell:

Beside this specific Flagrant Conduct: The Story of Lawrence v. Texas in your phone, it might give you a
way to get more close to the new knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you will got here
is fresh from the oven so don't always be worry if you feel like an older people live in narrow village. It is
good thing to have Flagrant Conduct: The Story of Lawrence v. Texas because this book offers to your
account readable information. Do you at times have book but you don't get what it's facts concerning. Oh
come on, that won't happen if you have this in your hand. The Enjoyable blend here cannot be questionable,
including treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss this? Find this book along with read it from
currently!

Benjamin Herrera:

Is it you who having spare time after that spend it whole day by simply watching television programs or just
lying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Flagrant Conduct: The Story of Lawrence v. Texas can
be the response, oh how comes? A book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your extra time
by reading in this brand-new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these books have than the others?

Ali Ellison:

A lot of book has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by world wide web on social media.
You can choose the top book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is
called of book Flagrant Conduct: The Story of Lawrence v. Texas. Contain your knowledge by it. Without
making the printed book, it might add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most essential
that, you must aware about guide. It can bring you from one destination for a other place.
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