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In February 1945, the Allies launched Operation Thunderclap, a series of maximum efforts against cities in
eastern Germany, partly to pave the way for the Red Army that would soon be overrunning that territory.
These deep-penetration raids would tax the bomber crews immensely, as well as bring new devastation to
cities yet untouched by U.S. airpower.

Two B-17 crew members, a co-pilot and gunner, trained together in Gulfport, MS, and in fall 1944 were
assigned to the longest-serving and most decorated U.S. bomb group in England. However, their paths then
diverged. The co-pilot flew 31 missions until war’s end; the gunner was shot down and captured on his very
first combat mission. These crew members both lived—one through Thunderclap and one through the Black
March—and this is their story: an account of both constant air combat and travail on the ground.

This work includes a firsthand view of the bombing of Dresden, perhaps the worst cataclysm inflicted by
bombers in the West. The co-pilot participated in these attacks, where he witnessed a city already too far
destroyed to expend additional bombs. Meantime the gunner, shot down and parachuting into enemy
territory, was taken prisoner by the Germans, and then forced to endure “The Black March,” an effort by the
Nazis to move all their prisoners beyond the Red Army’s advancing spearheads. Of 6,000 Allied POWs put
on the roads from northern Poland, in a 500-mile, three-month trek, a quarter died due to the elements,
disease and starvation.

The gunner survived the March, and once the sands ran out for Germany experienced a period in Soviet
captivity. During the day he thought their men behaved; but after dark there was chaos as the Red Army
wreaked its revenge. This unique book on the Allied air campaign offers new insights into what our fliers
truly saw and experienced during the war.
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From reader reviews:

Emile Guzman:

With other case, little people like to read book Operation Thunderclap and the Black March: Two Stories
from the Unstoppable 91st Bomb Group. You can choose the best book if you love reading a book. Given
that we know about how is important any book Operation Thunderclap and the Black March: Two Stories
from the Unstoppable 91st Bomb Group. You can add knowledge and of course you can around the world
with a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can learn everything! From your country until
eventually foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple matter until wonderful thing you may know
that. In this era, we can open a book or searching by internet system. It is called e-book. You may use it
when you feel bored to go to the library. Let's read.

David Simpson:

Do you one among people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold on
guys this specific aren't like that. This Operation Thunderclap and the Black March: Two Stories from the
Unstoppable 91st Bomb Group book is readable simply by you who hate those straight word style. You will
find the details here are arrange for enjoyable reading experience without leaving actually decrease the
knowledge that want to provide to you. The writer regarding Operation Thunderclap and the Black March:
Two Stories from the Unstoppable 91st Bomb Group content conveys prospect easily to understand by a lot
of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the content material but it just different such as it. So ,
do you still thinking Operation Thunderclap and the Black March: Two Stories from the Unstoppable 91st
Bomb Group is not loveable to be your top listing reading book?

Stanley Hanson:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading addiction
give you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside
the book in which improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of
publication you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want feel
happy read one using theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. The actual Operation Thunderclap
and the Black March: Two Stories from the Unstoppable 91st Bomb Group is kind of book which is giving
the reader capricious experience.

Shannon Thompson:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their
family, or their very own friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, going to
beach, or picnic from the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to
something different to fill your current free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book may be option
to fill your cost-free time/ holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of book that you should



read. If you want to consider look for book, may be the publication untitled Operation Thunderclap and the
Black March: Two Stories from the Unstoppable 91st Bomb Group can be good book to read. May be it
could be best activity to you.
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