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Following in the footsteps of Napoleon's army, Europeans invaded Egypt in the early nineteenth century to
gaze in wonder at the massive, inscrutable remains of its ancient civilizations. One of these travelers was a
twenty-four-year-old Englishman, John Gardner Wilkinson. His copious observations of ancient and modern
Egyptian places, artifacts, and lifeways, recorded in such widely read publications as Manners and Customs
of the Ancient Egyptians and Handbook for Travellers in Egypt, made him the leading early Victorian
authority on ancient Egypt and paved the way for thc scientific study of Egyptology.

In this first full-scale biography of Wilkinson (1797-1875), Jason Thompson skillfully portrays both the man
and his era. He follows Wilkinson during his initial sojourn in Egypt (1821-1833) as Wilkinson immersed
himself in a contemporary Egyptian lifestyle and in study of its ancient past. He shows Wilkinson in his
circle of friends—among them Edward William Lane, Robert Hay and Frederick Catherwood. And he traces
how Wilkinson continued to use his Egyptian material in the decades following his return to England.

With the rise of professional Egyptology in the middle and later nineteenth century, Sir Gardner Wilkinson
came to be viewed as an amateur and his popularity diminished. Drawing upon recently opened sources,
Thompson returns Wilkinson to his rightful place within centuries of Egyptian scholarship and assesses both
the vision and the limitations of his work. The result is a compelling portrait of a Victorian "gentleman-
scholar" and his cultural milieu.
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From reader reviews:

Linda Henderson:

Throughout other case, little individuals like to read book Sir Gardner Wilkinson and His Circle. You can
choose the best book if you love reading a book. As long as we know about how is important a book Sir
Gardner Wilkinson and His Circle. You can add information and of course you can around the world by a
book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can know everything! From your country until
eventually foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple factor until wonderful thing you could know
that. In this era, we can easily open a book or maybe searching by internet system. It is called e-book. You
can use it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's examine.

Stuart Rosado:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to decide on book
like comic, limited story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not trying Sir Gardner
Wilkinson and His Circle that give your pleasure preference will be satisfied through reading this book.
Reading practice all over the world can be said as the opportinity for people to know world considerably
better then how they react to the world. It can't be explained constantly that reading routine only for the
geeky man but for all of you who wants to possibly be success person. So , for all of you who want to start
looking at as your good habit, you may pick Sir Gardner Wilkinson and His Circle become your own starter.

Jennifer Johnson:

Reading a book for being new life style in this year; every people loves to learn a book. When you examine a
book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge,
because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book
that you have read. If you would like get information about your research, you can read education books, but
if you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, in addition to
soon. The Sir Gardner Wilkinson and His Circle will give you a new experience in studying a book.

Debra Davin:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This book Sir Gardner Wilkinson and His Circle was bright colored
and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book Sir Gardner Wilkinson and His Circle has many
kinds or genre. Start from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or Private investigator Conan you can
read and think you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book are usually make you bored, any it
can make you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book to suit your needs and try to like
reading that will.
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