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Explore silk--an alluring and exotic fiber for spinners!

The Practical Spinner's Guide: Silk teaches spinners how to create smooth lustrous yarns from a gorgeous
but tricky and sometimes intimidating fiber in this second installment in a series of fiber specific books.
Author Sara Lamb discusses the various forms in which silk is available--combed top, bricks, noils, hankies,
and bells--and how best to card, prep, and spin them, specifically touching on trouble spots such as drafting
and adding twist. She also covers finishing yarns--cleaning and degumming, setting twist, and plying--and
even touches on what dye processes are best for adding color, as well as how to blend silk into other spinning
fibers.

Sara includes brief discussions on spinning for both knitting and weaving, the properties of woven and
knitted fabric, and what the spinner needs to take into account while creating yarn for a subsequent project.
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From reader reviews:

Diana Elliott:

With other case, little persons like to read book The Practical Spinner's Guide - Silk. You can choose the best
book if you like reading a book. Given that we know about how is important the book The Practical
Spinner's Guide - Silk. You can add understanding and of course you can around the world by just a book.
Absolutely right, mainly because from book you can recognize everything! From your country until foreign
or abroad you can be known. About simple point until wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, we
can open a book or perhaps searching by internet system. It is called e-book. You need to use it when you
feel fed up to go to the library. Let's learn.

Emma Englund:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a book will give you a lot of new
facts. When you read a guide you will get new information due to the fact book is one of a number of ways
to share the information or even their idea. Second, reading through a book will make you actually more
imaginative. When you reading a book especially fictional book the author will bring someone to imagine
the story how the character types do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to other
individuals. When you read this The Practical Spinner's Guide - Silk, you could tells your family, friends and
also soon about yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a publication.

Gregorio Leslie:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with good friends is thing
that usually you could have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try thing that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you are ride on and with addition details. Even you love The Practical Spinner's Guide - Silk, you
could enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still need to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh
come on its mind hangout men. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on its identified as reading friends.

Ron Matthies:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book
compared to can satisfy your limited time to read it because all of this time you only find guide that need
more time to be examine. The Practical Spinner's Guide - Silk can be your answer as it can be read by you
who have those short spare time problems.
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