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Award-winning author David Almond reintroduces readers to the perceptive, sensitive Mina before the
events of Skellig in this lyrical and fantastical work. My Name is Mina is not only a pleasure to read, it is an
intimate and enlightening look at a character whose open mind and heart have much to teach us about life,
love, and the mysteries that surround us.

Mina loves the night. While everyone else is in a deep slumber, she gazes out the window, witness to the
moon's silvery light. In the stillness, she can even hear her own heart beating. This is when Mina feels that
anything is possible and her imagination is set free.

A blank notebook lies on the table. It has been there for what seems like forever. Mina has proclaimed in the
past that she will use it as a journal, and one night, at last, she begins to do just that. As she writes, Mina
makes discoveries both trivial and profound about herself and her world, her thoughts and her dreams.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Phyllis Baudoin:

In other case, little individuals like to read book My Name Is Mina. You can choose the best book if you love
reading a book. So long as we know about how is important a new book My Name Is Mina. You can add
information and of course you can around the world by just a book. Absolutely right, simply because from
book you can realize everything! From your country until finally foreign or abroad you can be known. About
simple matter until wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, you can open a book or searching by
internet gadget. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's
examine.

Sammy Cheney:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As we know
that book is very important normally. The book My Name Is Mina was making you to know about other
expertise and of course you can take more information. It is quite advantages for you. The reserve My Name
Is Mina is not only giving you considerably more new information but also to become your friend when you
experience bored. You can spend your current spend time to read your book. Try to make relationship with
the book My Name Is Mina. You never sense lose out for everything when you read some books.

Debra Capone:

This My Name Is Mina is completely new way for you who has interest to look for some information mainly
because it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you in it getting knowledge more you know otherwise you
who still having little bit of digest in reading this My Name Is Mina can be the light food for you because the
information inside this book is easy to get by simply anyone. These books acquire itself in the form which
can be reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book form. People who think that in reserve form make
them feel sleepy even dizzy this e-book is the answer. So you cannot find any in reading a publication
especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for you actually. So , don't miss
the item! Just read this e-book sort for your better life and also knowledge.

Edward Doucet:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got college students? We believe that that
concern was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby.
Therefore you know that little person just like reading or as looking at become their hobby. You must know
that reading is very important along with book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to incorporate you
knowledge, except your teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update with regards to something by
book. A substantial number of sorts of books that can you take to be your object. One of them is this My
Name Is Mina.
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