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The Taj Mahal is synonymous with Agra. But, as Royina Grewal discovers in her wanderings, there is much
more to the city. Its strategic location on important trade routes attracted empire-builders from the Lodhis to
the Mughals and the British, each of whom left their mark. Now, however, Agra has fallen prey to apathy
and neglect. Large parts of the city have succumbed to decay and haphazard development, and the Yamuna
River has become a stream of sludge. Only the spirit and enterprise of the everyday inhabitants of the once-
glorious city sustain it.
Juxtaposing the past with the present, delving into myth and history, and drawing upon her interactions with
the city’s diverse population, Grewal takes the reader on a fascinating journey through Agra, exploring its
lanes and by-lanes, and its attractions other than the Taj, even as she investigates the significance of the
monument in the lives of the locals. And as she helps us understand the reasons for Agra’s spectacular
decline, she also shows us signs of hope, looking at ways in which the city can be restored to some of its
former glory. This revised edition of In the Shadow of the Taj is not just an ode to the city’s past, but also
offers deep and often surprising insights into its present, and its future.
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From reader reviews:

Rose Villegas:

Throughout other case, little persons like to read book In the shadow of the taj. You can choose the best book
if you like reading a book. Given that we know about how is important some sort of book In the shadow of
the taj. You can add information and of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right,
because from book you can know everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you may be known.
About simple factor until wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, you can open a book or even
searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel weary to go to the library.
Let's read.

Sharon Hafer:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information
quicker to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, newspaper,
book, and soon. You will see that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended to you is In the shadow of the taj this publication consist a lot of the information of the
condition of this world now. This book was represented how can the world has grown up. The vocabulary
styles that writer value to explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer made some analysis when he
makes this book. This is why this book suitable all of you.

Eric Sanders:

You may get this In the shadow of the taj by browse the bookstore or Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it can
to be your solve challenge if you get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not
only simply by written or printed but can you enjoy this book by means of e-book. In the modern era like
now, you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your own
ways to get more information about your guide. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your
knowledge are still update. Let's try to choose right ways for you.

Carlton Wood:

That book can make you to feel relax. This particular book In the shadow of the taj was multi-colored and of
course has pictures on there. As we know that book In the shadow of the taj has many kinds or type. Start
from kids until young adults. For example Naruto or Private eye Conan you can read and think you are the
character on there. Therefore , not at all of book are make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and
loosen up. Try to choose the best book in your case and try to like reading this.
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