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No one wants to be treated like an object, regarded as an item of property, or put up for sale. Yet many
people frame personal autonomy in terms of self-ownership, representing themselves as property owners
with the right to do as they wish with their bodies. Others do not use the language of property, but are
similarly insistent on the rights of free individuals to decide for themselves whether to engage in commercial
transactions for sex, reproduction, or organ sales. Drawing on analyses of rape, surrogacy, and markets in
human organs, Our Bodies, Whose Property? challenges notions of freedom based on ownership of our
bodies and argues against the normalization of markets in bodily services and parts. Anne Phillips explores
the risks associated with metaphors of property and the reasons why the commodification of the body
remains problematic.

What, she asks, is wrong with thinking of oneself as the owner of one's body? What is wrong with making
our bodies available for rent or sale? What, if anything, is the difference between markets in sex,
reproduction, or human body parts, and the other markets we commonly applaud? Phillips contends that
body markets occupy the outer edges of a continuum that is, in some way, a feature of all labor markets. But
she also emphasizes that we all have bodies, and considers the implications of this otherwise banal fact for
equality. Bodies remind us of shared vulnerability, alerting us to the common experience of living as
embodied beings in the same world.

Examining the complex issue of body exceptionalism, Our Bodies, Whose Property? demonstrates that
treating the body as property makes human equality harder to comprehend.
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From reader reviews:

Thomas Abrams:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading
book so. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new
data. When you read a guide you will get new information because book is one of various ways to share the
information or their idea. Second, reading through a book will make you actually more imaginative. When
you studying a book especially hype book the author will bring you to imagine the story how the character
types do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to some others. When you read this Our Bodies,
Whose Property?, it is possible to tells your family, friends along with soon about yours book. Your
knowledge can inspire average, make them reading a e-book.

Joycelyn Chambers:

With this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability to do something more are more precious
than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple way to have that. What you have to
do is just spending your time very little but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of several books
in the top record in your reading list is actually Our Bodies, Whose Property?. This book and that is qualified
as The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking right up and review this
publication you can get many advantages.

Earnest Moss:

You may get this Our Bodies, Whose Property? by check out the bookstore or Mall. Just viewing or
reviewing it could to be your solve problem if you get difficulties for your knowledge. Kinds of this guide
are various. Not only simply by written or printed but can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern era
like now, you just looking because of your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now,
choose your ways to get more information about your e-book. It is most important to arrange yourself to
make your knowledge are still revise. Let's try to choose proper ways for you.

Albert Fragoso:

E-book is one of source of understanding. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen need book to know the update information of year for you to year. As we know
those publications have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, could also bring us to around
the world. Through the book Our Bodies, Whose Property? we can have more advantage. Don't that you be
creative people? To get creative person must love to read a book. Just simply choose the best book that
appropriate with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life at this book Our Bodies, Whose
Property?. You can more attractive than now.
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