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A bold and provocative book about Australia's national identity and a plea to keep Australia's famed open-
mindedness, Cater tracks the seismic changes in Australian culture and outlook since Donald Horne
published THE LUCKY COUNTRY in 1964. 'A great book.' Rupert Murdoch A bold and provocative book
about Australia's national identity and how it is threatened by the rise of a ruling class. Nick Cater, senior
editor at the Australian, tracks the seismic changes in Australian culture and outlook since Donald Horne
wrote the Lucky Country in 1964. His belief is that countries don't get lucky; people do. the secret of
Australia's good fortune is not found in its geography or history. the key to its success is the Australian
character, the nation's greatest renewable resource. Liberated from the constraints of the old world,
Australia's pioneers mined their reserves of enterprise, energy and ingenuity to build the great civilization of
the south. their over-riding principle was fairness: everybody had a right to a fair go and was obliged to do
the right thing by others. today that spirit of egalitarianism is threatened by the rise of a new breed of
sophisticated Australians - the 'bunyip alumni' - who claim to better understand the demands of the age. their
presumption of elitism and superior virtue tempts them to look down on others and dismiss opposing views.
Half a century after Donald Horne named Australia 'the Lucky Country', Nick Cater takes stock of the new
battle to define Australia and the rift that divides a presumptive ruling class from a people who refuse to be
ruled. the Lucky Culture is a lively and original take on 21st century Australia and its people. Sometimes
rousing, often provocative and always good-humoured, its unexpectedly moving message cannot be ignored.
'tHE LUCKY CULtURE is a great book and particularly relevant as it comes in a moment of high political
excitement. I particularly loved Nick Cater's passion for the great Australian dream. It is the first step in
restoring that dream.' Rupert Murdoch
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From reader reviews:

Margarita Toman:

Book is written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a e-book.
Book has a different type. As we know that book is important factor to bring us around the world. Alongside
that you can your reading ability was fluently. A reserve The Lucky Culture And The Rise Of An Australian
Ruling Class will make you to possibly be smarter. You can feel more confidence if you can know about
everything. But some of you think that will open or reading some sort of book make you bored. It's not make
you fun. Why they can be thought like that? Have you seeking best book or ideal book with you?

Ruth Westlund:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the subject The Lucky
Culture And The Rise Of An Australian Ruling Class suitable to you? Often the book was written by
renowned writer in this era. Often the book untitled The Lucky Culture And The Rise Of An Australian
Ruling Classis one of several books that everyone read now. This particular book was inspired a lot of people
in the world. When you read this book you will enter the new dimensions that you ever know ahead of. The
author explained their concept in the simple way, and so all of people can easily to recognise the core of this
guide. This book will give you a lot of information about this world now. To help you see the represented of
the world within this book.

James Brady:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them
family members or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching
TV, or maybe playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity honestly, that is
look different you can read any book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book which you read you
can spent the whole day to reading a guide. The book The Lucky Culture And The Rise Of An Australian
Ruling Class it is very good to read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. They were
enjoying reading this book. When you did not have enough space to develop this book you can buy the
particular e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this book from your smart phone. The price is not to fund
but this book provides high quality.

Norma Brier:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got scholars? We believe that that issue was
given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. And also you know
that little person similar to reading or as reading through become their hobby. You should know that reading
is very important in addition to book as to be the point. Book is important thing to incorporate you
knowledge, except your personal teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update regarding something
by book. Amount types of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is actually The
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