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Private detective Savannah Reid isn’t your average crime-fighting heroine. Middle-aged and overweight—at
least by society’s skinny-winnie standards—Savannah has the audacity to love herself anyway. If there’s
anything the sassy Dixie belle enjoys more than cooking soul-satisfying food for her friends and family, it’s
nabbing bad guys and plopping them on the scales of Lady Justice. Having relocated to Southern California,
this unconventional Georgia peach and the equally eccentric members of her Moonlight Magnolia Detective
Agency live to take a tasty bite out of crime in the sleepy, seaside town of San Carmelita.

Under ordinary circumstances, deliciously gluttonous, private detective Savannah Reid wouldn’t be caught
dead in a toxin-cleansing, exercise-till-you-drop, eat-seaweed-goop health spa. But murder is no ordinary
circumstance, and Savannah has to catch a killer. Of course, to do that she has to stay alive, and she’s
starting to think this place and its grueling regimen (not to mention the bowls of gruel) will be the death of
her. She’s wondering what her official Cause of Death will be: starvation, exhaustion, or murder in the first
degree, in KILLER CALORIES. 
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From reader reviews:

Chris Bynum:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive right now, people have
do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice by means
of surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated the idea for a while is reading.
That's why, by reading a reserve your ability to survive improve then having chance to stand up than other is
high. For you who want to start reading any book, we give you this particular Killer Calories (A Savannah
Reid Mystery Book 3) book as starter and daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is more than just a
book.

Kenny Grant:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray a person, why because this Killer Calories (A Savannah Reid Mystery
Book 3) e-book written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book that may be
understand by anyone who read the book. Written within good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas
and producing skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still doubt Killer Calories (A Savannah
Reid Mystery Book 3) as good book not simply by the cover but also by the content. This is one book that
can break don't assess book by its deal with, so do you still needing yet another sixth sense to pick this kind
of!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening to another sixth
sense.

Marie Slaughter:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Killer Calories (A Savannah Reid Mystery Book
3) was bright colored and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book Killer Calories (A Savannah
Reid Mystery Book 3) has many kinds or variety. Start from kids until young adults. For example Naruto or
Private eye Conan you can read and think that you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book are
generally make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book for you
personally and try to like reading which.

Liza Serrano:

Reserve is one of source of know-how. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students and also
native or citizen have to have book to know the revise information of year to year. As we know those books
have many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the world. With the book
Killer Calories (A Savannah Reid Mystery Book 3) we can take more advantage. Don't someone to be
creative people? To be creative person must love to read a book. Just choose the best book that appropriate
with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life at this book Killer Calories (A Savannah Reid Mystery
Book 3). You can more desirable than now.
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