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Why did the British, then the leading nation in science and technology, fall far behind in the race to develop
the aeroplane before the First World War? Despite their initial advantage, they were overtaken by the Wright
brothers in America, by the French and the Germans. Peter Reese, in this highly readable and highly
illustrated account, delves into the fascinating early history of aviation as he describes what happened and
why. He recalls the brilliant theoretical work of Sir George Cayley, the inventions of other pioneers of the
nineteenth century and the daring exploits of the next generation of airmen, among them Samuel Cody, A.V.
Roe, Bertram Dickson, Charles Rolls and Tommy Sopwith. His narrative is illustrated with a wonderful
selection of over 120 archive drawings and photographs which record the men and the primitive flying
machines of a century ago.??As featured on BBC Radio Surrey and in Essence Magazine.
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From reader reviews:

Ralph Garibay:

The knowledge that you get from The Men Who Gave us Wings: Britain and the Aeroplane 1796-1914 is a
more deep you looking the information that hide into the words the more you get enthusiastic about reading
it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to be aware of but The Men Who Gave us Wings: Britain and the
Aeroplane 1796-1914 giving you joy feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in certain way that
can be understood by simply anyone who read the idea because the author of this publication is well-known
enough. This particular book also makes your own personal vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to
understand then can go along, both in printed or e-book style are available. We recommend you for having
this kind of The Men Who Gave us Wings: Britain and the Aeroplane 1796-1914 instantly.

Mindy Marcotte:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the subject The Men Who Gave
us Wings: Britain and the Aeroplane 1796-1914 suitable to you? The particular book was written by
renowned writer in this era. The book untitled The Men Who Gave us Wings: Britain and the Aeroplane
1796-1914is one of several books that everyone read now. This kind of book was inspired many men and
women in the world. When you read this reserve you will enter the new dimension that you ever know just
before. The author explained their idea in the simple way, so all of people can easily to recognise the core of
this reserve. This book will give you a lots of information about this world now. In order to see the
represented of the world within this book.

Daniel Buch:

The book untitled The Men Who Gave us Wings: Britain and the Aeroplane 1796-1914 is the guide that
recommended to you to study. You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to you
actually. The language that writer use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The author was did a
lot of analysis when write the book, hence the information that they share to you is absolutely accurate. You
also could possibly get the e-book of The Men Who Gave us Wings: Britain and the Aeroplane 1796-1914
from the publisher to make you considerably more enjoy free time.

Maria Antoine:

Reserve is one of source of knowledge. We can add our knowledge from it. Not only for students but native
or citizen need book to know the revise information of year for you to year. As we know those ebooks have
many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world. From the book
The Men Who Gave us Wings: Britain and the Aeroplane 1796-1914 we can consider more advantage. Don't
you to be creative people? To be creative person must love to read a book. Only choose the best book that
acceptable with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life by this book The Men Who Gave us
Wings: Britain and the Aeroplane 1796-1914. You can more attractive than now.
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