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Robert Chambers returns with a new book that reviews, together for the first time, some of the revolutionary
changes in the methodologies and methods of development inquiry that have occurred in the past forty years,
and reflects on their transformative potential for the future.

This book breaks new ground by describing and analysing the evolution of a sequence of approaches.
Starting with the dinosaurs of large-scale multi-subject questionnaire surveys, and the biased visits and
perceptions of rural development tourism and urban-based professionals, there follows a look at the
explosive proliferation of methodologies and methods of recent years. These include rapid rural appraisal
(RRA) participatory rural appraisal (PRA) and dramatic developments in the still largely unrecognized fields
of participatory numbers and statistics, and of participatory mapping and GIS. Chambers shows how these
can empower local people and provide rigorous and valid substitutes for some more traditional methods of
inquiry. Also presented is a repertoire for offsetting the biases of the urban trap, which has become so serious
for officials and aid agency staff. Importantly, Chambers points out that we are now in a different space,
methodologically, from a few years ago. He makes the case that participatory methodologies, evolved
through creative and eclectic pluralism, can be a transformative wave for the future as drivers of personal,
professional and institutional change. This book is for all who are concerned with development, regardless of
profession, discipline or organization, who seek to be abreast of the revolutionary breakthroughs in
approaches and methods of inquiry of recent years, and what Chambers calls their 'unlimited potentials'.
Published with IDS.
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From reader reviews:

Mable Garza:

The experience that you get from Revolutions in Development Inquiry could be the more deep you rooting
the information that hide in the words the more you get serious about reading it. It doesn't mean that this
book is hard to understand but Revolutions in Development Inquiry giving you enjoyment feeling of reading.
The copy writer conveys their point in certain way that can be understood simply by anyone who read the
item because the author of this book is well-known enough. This particular book also makes your own
vocabulary increase well. That makes it easy to understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-book
style are available. We suggest you for having this specific Revolutions in Development Inquiry instantly.

Lucille Chenier:

The guide untitled Revolutions in Development Inquiry is the publication that recommended to you to learn.
You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to anyone. The language that article author
use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The copy writer was did a lot of analysis when write the
book, to ensure the information that they share to you personally is absolutely accurate. You also could get
the e-book of Revolutions in Development Inquiry from the publisher to make you much more enjoy free
time.

Juana Rummel:

Often the book Revolutions in Development Inquiry has a lot info on it. So when you make sure to read this
book you can get a lot of help. The book was compiled by the very famous author. The writer makes some
research previous to write this book. That book very easy to read you can find the point easily after reading
this article book.

Joseph Wilds:

The reason why? Because this Revolutions in Development Inquiry is an unordinary book that the inside of
the e-book waiting for you to snap this but latter it will distress you with the secret the item inside. Reading
this book close to it was fantastic author who write the book in such awesome way makes the content on the
inside easier to understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning completely. So , it is good for you
because of not hesitating having this ever again or you going to regret it. This phenomenal book will give
you a lot of benefits than the other book have got such as help improving your skill and your critical thinking
approach. So , still want to postpone having that book? If I were you I will go to the book store hurriedly.
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