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A bold fantasy in the tradition of Roger Zelazny's Chronicles of Amber, The Merchant Princes is a sweeping
new series from the hottest new writer in science fiction!

Miriam Beckstein is happy in her life. She's a successful reporter for a hi-tech magazine in Boston, making
good money doing what she loves. When her researcher brings her iron-clad evidence of a money-laundering
scheme, Miriam thinks she's found the story of the year. But when she takes it to her editor, she's fired on the
spot and gets a death threat from the criminals she has uncovered.

Before the day is over, she's received a locket left by the mother she never knew-the mother who was
murdered when she was an infant. Within is a knotwork pattern, which has a hypnotic effect on her. Before
she knows it, she's transported herself to a parallel Earth, a world where knights on horseback chase their
prey with automatic weapons, and where world-skipping assassins lurk just on the other side of reality - a
world where her true family runs things.

The six families of the Clan rule the kingdom of Gruinmarkt from behind the scenes, a mixture of nobility
and criminal conspirators whose power to walk between the worlds makes them rich in both. Braids of
family loyalty and intermarriage provide a fragile guarantee of peace, but a recently-ended civil war has left
the families shaken and suspicious.

Taken in by her mother's people, she becomes the star of the story of the century-as Cinderella without a
fairy godmother. As her mother's heir, Miriam is hailed as the prodigal countess Helge Thorold-Hjorth, and
feted and feasted. Caught up in schemes and plots centuries in the making, Miriam is surrounded by unlikely
allies, forbidden loves, lethal contraband, and, most dangerous of all, her family. Her unexpected return will
supercede the claims of other clan members to her mother's fortune and power, and whoever killed her
mother will be happy to see her dead, too.

Behind all this lie deeper secrets still, which threaten everyone and everything she has ever known. Patterns
of deception and interlocking lies, as intricate as the knotwork between the universes. But Miriam is no one's
pawn, and is determined to conquer her new home on her own terms.

Blending the creativity and humor of Roger Zelazny, the adventure of H. Beam Piper and Philip Jose
Farmer, and the rigor and scope of a science-fiction writer on the grandest scale, Charles Stross has set a new
standard for fantasy epics.
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From reader reviews:

Linda Hill:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different content. We all
know that that book is very important normally. The book The Family Trade (Merchant Princes Book 1) has
been making you to know about other understanding and of course you can take more information. It is
rather advantages for you. The reserve The Family Trade (Merchant Princes Book 1) is not only giving you
considerably more new information but also to get your friend when you really feel bored. You can spend
your own personal spend time to read your book. Try to make relationship while using book The Family
Trade (Merchant Princes Book 1). You never truly feel lose out for everything should you read some books.

Vincent Johnson:

Beside this kind of The Family Trade (Merchant Princes Book 1) in your phone, it can give you a way to get
nearer to the new knowledge or info. The information and the knowledge you can got here is fresh from your
oven so don't always be worry if you feel like an outdated people live in narrow commune. It is good thing to
have The Family Trade (Merchant Princes Book 1) because this book offers to your account readable
information. Do you often have book but you do not get what it's about. Oh come on, that wil happen if you
have this in the hand. The Enjoyable blend here cannot be questionable, just like treasuring beautiful island.
Use you still want to miss it? Find this book and also read it from currently!

Robert Spann:

This The Family Trade (Merchant Princes Book 1) is fresh way for you who has fascination to look for some
information because it relief your hunger associated with. Getting deeper you onto it getting knowledge more
you know otherwise you who still having bit of digest in reading this The Family Trade (Merchant Princes
Book 1) can be the light food for yourself because the information inside this specific book is easy to get
through anyone. These books develop itself in the form which can be reachable by anyone, that's why I mean
in the e-book type. People who think that in publication form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this book is
the answer. So you cannot find any in reading a publication especially this one. You can find actually
looking for. It should be here for anyone. So , don't miss this! Just read this e-book sort for your better life in
addition to knowledge.

Anthony Moss:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is composed or printed or illustrated from each source that will filled update
of news. In this modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for you. From media
social like newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You can
add your understanding by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
searching for the The Family Trade (Merchant Princes Book 1) when you essential it?
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