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James Earl Carter, Jr. – better known as Jimmy Carter – was not the greatest or most popular president of the
United States but he did accomplish quite a lot in the fields of civil rights, energy and foreign policy during
his term from 1977 to 1981. However, the economy fared badly and he lost face in his dealings with Iran. So
when he left after one term, he was not greatly missed… or so it seemed. For, after the presidency, he made
an amazing comeback as a diplomat and trouble-shooter in international crises, becoming an amazing ex-
president. And even the earlier views of his presidency have been improving… at least he did not get the
country into a war.

This rather special trajectory is explained in the Historical Dictionary of the Carter Era, with an obvious
focus on his term as president. His run for the presidency and what he did during his term in office is traced
carefully by the chronology. The introduction takes a longer view and also puts events in a broader context.
Then the dictionary section, with hundreds of detailed and cross-referenced entries, tells us more about his
policy in various fields but also how America changed culturally and socially during this period. The
extensive bibliography points toward further information, although this book is certainly a good starting
point and also a place to refresh one’s memory.
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From reader reviews:

John Tibbs:

This Historical Dictionary of the Carter Era (Historical Dictionaries of U.S. Politics and Political Eras) book
is simply not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you have by reading this
book is information inside this publication incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper you
actually read a lot of information you will get. This kind of Historical Dictionary of the Carter Era (Historical
Dictionaries of U.S. Politics and Political Eras) without we comprehend teach the one who studying it
become critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't be worry Historical Dictionary of the Carter Era (Historical
Dictionaries of U.S. Politics and Political Eras) can bring once you are and not make your case space or
bookshelves' grow to be full because you can have it within your lovely laptop even mobile phone. This
Historical Dictionary of the Carter Era (Historical Dictionaries of U.S. Politics and Political Eras) having
very good arrangement in word and layout, so you will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Lily Tarver:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book in
comparison with can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because all this time you only find book
that need more time to be learn. Historical Dictionary of the Carter Era (Historical Dictionaries of U.S.
Politics and Political Eras) can be your answer given it can be read by a person who have those short time
problems.

Arlene Farrar:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside having friends, fun activity having family or just
watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by studying a book.
Ugh, you think reading a book really can hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It okay you
can have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Historical
Dictionary of the Carter Era (Historical Dictionaries of U.S. Politics and Political Eras) which is getting the
e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's see.

Sandra Fritz:

In this particular era which is the greater individual or who has ability in doing something more are more
treasured than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple solution to have that.
What you have to do is just spending your time little but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. One of
many books in the top collection in your reading list will be Historical Dictionary of the Carter Era
(Historical Dictionaries of U.S. Politics and Political Eras). This book which can be qualified as The Hungry
Slopes can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking way up and review this reserve you can get
many advantages.
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