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Recommended by the Common Core State Standards for English Language Arts and Literacy as an
exemplary informational text.

For the captains of industry men like Andrew Carnegie, John D. Rockefeller, J. P. Morgan, and Henry Ford
the Gilded Age is a time of big money. Technology boomed with the invention of trains, telephones, electric
lights, harvesters, vacuum cleaners, and more. But for millions of immigrant workers, it is a time of big
struggles, with adults and children alike working 12 to 14 hours a day under extreme, dangerous conditions.
The disparity between the rich and the poor was dismaying, which prompted some people to action. In An
Age of Extremes, you'll meet Mother Jones, Ida Tarbell, Big Bill Haywood, Sam Gompers, and other movers
and shakers, and get swept up in the enthusiasm of Teddy Roosevelt. You'll also watch the United States take
its greatest role on the world stage since the Revolution, as it enters the bloody battlefields of Europe in
World War I.
 About the Series:
Master storyteller Joy Hakim has excited millions of young minds with the great drama of American history
in her award-winning series A History of US. Recommended by the Common Core State Standards for
English Language Arts and Literacy as an exemplary informational text, A History of US weaves together
exciting stories that bring American history to life. Hailed by reviewers, historians, educators, and parents for
its exciting, thought-provoking narrative, the books have been recognized as a break-through tool in teaching
history and critical reading skills to young people. In ten books that span from Prehistory to the 21st century,
young people will never think of American history as boring again.
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From reader reviews:

Joe Dix:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Yep, you can choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take
a walk, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or even read a book allowed A History of
US: An Age of Extremes: 1880-1917? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You already know beside you
can spend your time with your favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with their opinion or
you have different opinion?

William McDowell:

This book untitled A History of US: An Age of Extremes: 1880-1917 to be one of several books that best
seller in this year, that's because when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit into it. You will easily
to buy this particular book in the book shop or you can order it through online. The publisher in this book
sells the e-book too. It makes you more readily to read this book, as you can read this book in your Smart
phone. So there is no reason to you personally to past this publication from your list.

Laura Buscher:

This A History of US: An Age of Extremes: 1880-1917 is great publication for you because the content
which is full of information for you who all always deal with world and possess to make decision every
minute. This particular book reveal it info accurately using great plan word or we can declare no rambling
sentences within it. So if you are read this hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it only
offers you straight forward sentences but hard core information with splendid delivering sentences. Having A
History of US: An Age of Extremes: 1880-1917 in your hand like keeping the world in your arm,
information in it is not ridiculous a single. We can say that no reserve that offer you world inside ten or
fifteen second right but this guide already do that. So , this is certainly good reading book. Hey there Mr. and
Mrs. occupied do you still doubt this?

Heather Bly:

You can obtain this A History of US: An Age of Extremes: 1880-1917 by look at the bookstore or Mall.
Only viewing or reviewing it could possibly to be your solve issue if you get difficulties to your knowledge.
Kinds of this e-book are various. Not only by simply written or printed but can you enjoy this book by
simply e-book. In the modern era just like now, you just looking from your mobile phone and searching what
their problem. Right now, choose your personal ways to get more information about your guide. It is most
important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still update. Let's try to choose right ways
for you.
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