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"Outside the back window Alice can see the outlines of the garden, some of the furrows visible under the
snow, stretching away in long thin rows. She can't imagine doing the garden without her dad. It's his thing;
she's always thought of herself as his assistant at best. She can't imagine doing anything without her dad and
she starts to feel like she can't breathe. And then she looks at him. Just looks at him as he watches the fire
with muffin crumbs on his lap.
'I'll write to you.'
'I know, sweetheart.'
'Every day.'"
--From Alice Bliss

When Alice Bliss learns that her father, Matt, is being deployed to Iraq, she's heartbroken. Alice idolizes her
father, loves working beside him in their garden, accompanying him on the occasional roofing job, playing
baseball. When he ships out, Alice is faced with finding a way to fill the emptiness he has left behind.

Matt will miss seeing his daughter blossom from a tomboy into a full-blown teenager. Alice will learn to
drive, join the track team, go to her first dance, and fall in love, all while trying to be strong for her mother,
Angie, and take care of her precocious little sister, Ellie. But the smell of Matt is starting to fade from his
blue shirt that Alice wears everyday, and the phone calls are never long enough.

Alice Bliss is a profoundly moving coming-of-age novel about love and its many variations--the support of a
small town looking after its own; love between an absent father and his daughter; the complicated love
between an adolescent girl and her mother; and an exploration of new love with the boy-next-door. These
characters' struggles amidst uncertain times echo our own, lending the novel an immediacy and poignancy
that is both relevant and real. At once universal and very personal, Alice Bliss is a transforming story about
those who are left at home during wartime, and a teenage girl bravely facing the future.
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From reader reviews:

Margherita Pettit:

With other case, little people like to read book Alice Bliss: A Novel. You can choose the best book if you'd
prefer reading a book. Given that we know about how is important the book Alice Bliss: A Novel. You can
add expertise and of course you can around the world by just a book. Absolutely right, simply because from
book you can realize everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you may be known. About
simple point until wonderful thing you are able to know that. In this era, we can easily open a book or even
searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel uninterested to go to the
library. Let's examine.

Lisa Martin:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive now, people
have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place and
notice by simply surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated it for a while is
reading. Yes, by reading a book your ability to survive improve then having chance to remain than other is
high. For you who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this Alice Bliss: A Novel book as
nice and daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Robert Lofton:

The experience that you get from Alice Bliss: A Novel is a more deep you searching the information that
hide in the words the more you get thinking about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to be
aware of but Alice Bliss: A Novel giving you buzz feeling of reading. The copy writer conveys their point in
particular way that can be understood simply by anyone who read this because the author of this book is
well-known enough. That book also makes your current vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to
understand then can go with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We highly recommend you
for having that Alice Bliss: A Novel instantly.

John Cheung:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their spare time with their family,
or their friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, about to beach, or picnic from the park.
They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different to fill your current free
time/ holiday? Might be reading a book can be option to fill your free time/ holiday. The first thing you will
ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you want to try out look for book, may be the
publication untitled Alice Bliss: A Novel can be great book to read. May be it is usually best activity to you.
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