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Essayist, editor, columnist, author of many books, and winner of a special Pulitzer Prize citation in 1958 for
his powers of news analysis, Walter Lippmann both appraised and influenced twentieth-century American
politics. No other author of the century dealt with the persistent problems of politics from so many
approaches, was so widely read, or varied so widely in his conclusions.

Benjamin F. Wright’s study is the first book devoted to an exposition and analysis of Lippmann’s nine
“books of political philosophy,” as James Reston called them. These books provide a fascinating study of
changes in the political and economic ideas of the most important journalist of his time.

Lippmann’s books published in 1913 and 1914 reflect the optimism of the Progressive Era, of faith in
science and in the ability of people to choose their goals and attain them. In 1922 and 1925, while editor of
the New York World, Lippmann wrote searching, often pessimistic analyses of what he believed to be the
prevailing assumptions regarding the nature and role of public opinion. Although in the Coolidge era he
relegated government to a minor role as mediator, he became an enthusiastic defender of the achievements of
the early New Deal. Two years later in a longer look, he found the same New Deal following the path toward
totalitarianism. Keynes was discarded and his place taken by the economics of Adam Smith, bolstered by the
common law of Coke and the Constitution of the founders. Finally, in 1955, in the extremely popular and
very engaging Public Philosophy, there is a lament for the “decline of the West” and a plea to return to the
age of civility and natural law.

In a final analytical chapter, Wright presents a critique of Lippmann’s historical understanding and the
modern applications of the tradition of natural law. He also assesses Lippmann’s inability to translate the
“public philosophy” into programs or institutional changes and the failure to account for the expansion of
governmental functions together with the continued strength of constitutional democracy in the West.
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From reader reviews:

William McClanahan:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students since they are still students or the idea for all people
in the world, what the best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that question above. Every person
has diverse personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that they don't
wish do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Five Public Philosophies of Walter
Lippmann. All type of book are you able to see on many resources. You can look for the internet solutions or
other social media.

Donna Vandyne:

The guide untitled Five Public Philosophies of Walter Lippmann is the book that recommended to you you
just read. You can see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to a person. The language that
article author use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The article writer was did a lot of
investigation when write the book, so the information that they share for your requirements is absolutely
accurate. You also can get the e-book of Five Public Philosophies of Walter Lippmann from the publisher to
make you considerably more enjoy free time.

Louis Trent:

You are able to spend your free time to learn this book this publication. This Five Public Philosophies of
Walter Lippmann is simple to bring you can read it in the park, in the beach, train and soon. If you did not
have much space to bring typically the printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you quicker to read
it. You can save the book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one
buys this book.

Chris Holmes:

A lot of e-book has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by internet on social media. You
can choose the most beneficial book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by means of searching
from it. It is referred to as of book Five Public Philosophies of Walter Lippmann. You can include your
knowledge by it. Without making the printed book, it may add your knowledge and make you happier to
read. It is most significant that, you must aware about guide. It can bring you from one place to other place.
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