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Galia Golan's concise but richly detailed monograph gives us the first look at Soviet policy toward terrorism
under Gorbachev. Drawing on a wide array of Soviet sources, Dr. Golan traces the evolution in Soviet
attitudes toward terrorism and support for movements of national liberation from Brezhnev to Gorbachev.
She focuses specifically on the change in Soviet public positions toward a more explicit condemnation of
terrorist acts. The debate is likely to continue over whether changing public positions reflect an actual shift in
Soviet behavior, but Golan's book helps to frame that debate. All those who are interested in evaluating
Soviet `new thinking' on an important global and regional issue should read this book.

Dennis B. Ross Director, Policy Planning Staff U.S. Department of State

This book examines the reevaluation of Soviet foreign policy under Gorbachev, known as the new thinking.
This new foreign policy has produced a new Soviet attitude and, apparently, different behavior toward
terrorism. In the past, terrorism was officially condemned either as a method employed by imperialist or
capitalist regimes against an oppressed population or as an illegitimate offshoot of armed struggle, having
nothing in common with genuine liberation struggles. Under Gorbachev, there is a reduction in Soviet aid to
many groups using terrorism and a call for political solutions to ongoing conflicts. The latest volume in The
Washington Papers series, Gorbachev's New Thinking on Terrorism will be of special interest to political
scientists, Soviet specialists, or anyone interested in terrorism today.

With a foreword by Walter laqueur Laqueur, this book begins with a detailed background study of Soviet
attitudes toward terrorism, demonstrating the changes in Gorbachev's approach to the problem. Galia Golan,
Darwin professor of Soviet and East European Studies at the Hebrew University of Jerusalem, defines the
differences between Gorbachev's rhetoric and the reality of the new thinking as the book explores reports and
rumors of Soviet involvement in Pakistan and the Philippines. The book concludes with a look at current
Soviet policy toward terrorist groups traditionally backed by the Soviet Union.
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From reader reviews:

Nelson Wyatt:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them
household or their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, as
well as playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity here is look different you can
read some sort of book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent the
entire day to reading a guide. The book Gorbachev's New Thinking on Terrorism (Washington Papers
(Paperback)) it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book.
These people were enjoying reading this book. In the event you did not have enough space to bring this book
you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore simply to read this book out of your smart phone. The price is not
too costly but this book provides high quality.

Freddy Lamberth:

Gorbachev's New Thinking on Terrorism (Washington Papers (Paperback)) can be one of your beginner
books that are good idea. Many of us recommend that straight away because this publication has good
vocabulary which could increase your knowledge in words, easy to understand, bit entertaining but
nevertheless delivering the information. The article author giving his/her effort to set every word into
enjoyment arrangement in writing Gorbachev's New Thinking on Terrorism (Washington Papers
(Paperback)) yet doesn't forget the main position, giving the reader the hottest as well as based confirm
resource info that maybe you can be one of it. This great information can drawn you into completely new
stage of crucial pondering.

Doug Herring:

You can obtain this Gorbachev's New Thinking on Terrorism (Washington Papers (Paperback)) by go to the
bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it can to be your solve challenge if you get difficulties for
the knowledge. Kinds of this book are various. Not only by written or printed but can you enjoy this book
through e-book. In the modern era just like now, you just looking because of your mobile phone and
searching what your problem. Right now, choose your personal ways to get more information about your
publication. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to
choose proper ways for you.

Lloyd Gilbert:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from the book. Book is prepared or printed or illustrated from each source this filled update of
news. On this modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for a person. From
media social such as newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic.
You can add your knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just



trying to find the Gorbachev's New Thinking on Terrorism (Washington Papers (Paperback)) when you
desired it?
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