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When a young gymnast dies performing a world-famous stunt, Kiernan suspects foul play

As a young girl in Baltimore, Kiernan O’Shaughnessy lived for gymnastics, where strict discipline and
endless practice kept her centered even as her life fell apart. Her idol was stuntman Greg Gaige. Famous for
pulling off the moves no one else could, and for scorning safety equipment, Gaige was the one man
O’Shaughnessy truly admired.
 
Ten years after Gaige’s tragic death, O’Shaughnessy is a private detective on the California coast, and a
young female gymnast has come along to challenge Gaige’s crown. O’Shaughnessy goes to watch the girl
attempt the death-defying Gaige Move, without a harness, on the edge of a seaside cliff. After a perfect
landing, the ground gives way and the gymnast falls to her death. The police call it an accident, but
O’Shaughnessy is determined to get the truth—in honor of her old hero, and for the young woman who
looked up to him the way she did.

This ebook features an illustrated biography of Susan Dunlap including rare images from the author’s
personal collection.

High Fall is the 3rd book in the Kiernan O'Shaughnessy Mysteries, but you may enjoy reading the
series in any order.
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From reader reviews:

Brian Grant:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with good friends is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try factor that really
opposite from that. One particular activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like
on roller coaster you have been ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love High Fall (The
Kiernan O'Shaughnessy Mysteries), you could enjoy both. It is very good combination right, you still need to
miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh can occur its mind hangout people. What? Still don't get it, oh
come on its identified as reading friends.

Livia Wilder:

The book untitled High Fall (The Kiernan O'Shaughnessy Mysteries) contain a lot of information on the
item. The writer explains her idea with easy means. The language is very easy to understand all the people,
so do not really worry, you can easy to read it. The book was authored by famous author. The author brings
you in the new era of literary works. You can read this book because you can please read on your smart
phone, or program, so you can read the book within anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book,
you can open up their official web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice examine.

Sharon Hafer:

Beside this specific High Fall (The Kiernan O'Shaughnessy Mysteries) in your phone, it could give you a
way to get closer to the new knowledge or facts. The information and the knowledge you are going to got
here is fresh from your oven so don't become worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow
community. It is good thing to have High Fall (The Kiernan O'Shaughnessy Mysteries) because this book
offers for your requirements readable information. Do you often have book but you would not get what it's
interesting features of. Oh come on, that will not end up to happen if you have this with your hand. The
Enjoyable agreement here cannot be questionable, just like treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still
want to miss this? Find this book in addition to read it from at this point!

Charles Melendez:

E-book is one of source of knowledge. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but also
native or citizen require book to know the change information of year to help year. As we know those guides
have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the world. From
the book High Fall (The Kiernan O'Shaughnessy Mysteries) we can have more advantage. Don't you to be
creative people? To become creative person must choose to read a book. Just choose the best book that ideal
with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life with this book High Fall (The Kiernan O'Shaughnessy
Mysteries). You can more appealing than now.
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