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Whilst many books have been written on the history of the Parachute Regiment and Airborne Forces in
WWII, none of them have concentrated solely on the story of the 1st Parachute Brigade in North Africa
between 1942 and 1943. Helion and Company are therefore pleased to announce the publication of Tunisian
Tales - the 1st Parachute Brigade in North Africa 1942 - 1943 by Niall Cherry.

Tunisian Tales covers the raising of the Brigade in 1941 and training in the UK before their transfer to the
Mediterranean theater of operations. It also covers the three airborne operations carried out by the Brigade
there - Bone, Souk-el-Arba and Depienne/Oudna - in great detail.

The book is complemented by over 100 photos many never published before, several maps (including one
used by Lieutenant Colonel Pearson when in command of the 1st Parachute Battalion) and coverage of the
Airborne Medical Services in the area, besides extensive appendices.

This is Niall Cherry's third book for Helion following on from his highly successful previous titles - Most
Unfavorable Ground and Striking Back. As in his previous works, detailed research has been carried out
using official reports, war diaries and veterans' accounts. The book has the full approval of 'Airborne
Assault', the Museum of the Parachute Regiment and Airborne Forces at Duxford, and we are delighted that
its curator, Jon Baker, has contributed the Foreword.

Tunisian Tales represents a notable contribution to new research into the history of Britain's airborne forces.
It is being published in a strictly limited edition hardback run of 1,000 copies, each signed by the author and
individually numbered.
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From reader reviews:

Sylvia Johnson:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading
behavior give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge your information
inside the book which improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind
of e-book you read, if you want send more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want
experience happy read one together with theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. The particular
Tunisian Tales: The 1st Parachute Brigade in North Africa 1942-43 is kind of book which is giving the
reader erratic experience.

Susie Vadnais:

This book untitled Tunisian Tales: The 1st Parachute Brigade in North Africa 1942-43 to be one of several
books that best seller in this year, here is because when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit on it.
You will easily to buy this kind of book in the book store or you can order it by using online. The publisher
with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you easier to read this book, since you can read this book in
your Mobile phone. So there is no reason to you personally to past this e-book from your list.

Joshua Cameron:

Tunisian Tales: The 1st Parachute Brigade in North Africa 1942-43 can be one of your nice books that are
good idea. We all recommend that straight away because this publication has good vocabulary that can
increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the
information. The copy writer giving his/her effort that will put every word into joy arrangement in writing
Tunisian Tales: The 1st Parachute Brigade in North Africa 1942-43 yet doesn't forget the main place, giving
the reader the hottest and based confirm resource data that maybe you can be considered one of it. This great
information can easily drawn you into brand new stage of crucial imagining.

Rayford Alexander:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Tunisian Tales: The 1st Parachute Brigade in North
Africa 1942-43 was colourful and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book Tunisian Tales: The
1st Parachute Brigade in North Africa 1942-43 has many kinds or type. Start from kids until teenagers. For
example Naruto or Investigation company Conan you can read and think that you are the character on there.
So , not at all of book tend to be make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose
the best book to suit your needs and try to like reading in which.
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